
Oakview Drive Water Main Replacement
BID SUMMARY

Village of New Lenox
CBBEL Project No. 190293.00007

Bids Opened June 16, 2022

CONTRACTOR
BID ALTERNATE 1

Completion: Substantial - 11/30/2022
        Final - 5/12/2023

BID ALTERNATE 2
Completion: Final - 05/26/2023

ENGINEER'S ESTIMATE  $                               699,575.00 699,575.00$                               
AUSTIN TYLER CONSTRUCTION, INC.  $                               539,985.82 550,945.82$                               

LEN COX & SONS EXCAVATING  $                               629,935.00 619,935.00$                               
H. LINDEN & SONS SEWER AND WATER, INC.  $                               647,061.00 622,396.00$                               

HOLIDAY SEWER & WATER CONSTRUCTION, INC.  $                               647,325.00 NO BID
BISPING CONSTRUCTION  $                               732,483.00 732,483.00$                               

PT FERRO CONSTRUCTION CO.  NO BID 594,090.03$                               



Village of New Lenox
Oakview Drive Water Main Replacement Project 
Bid Alternate #1 - Substantial Completion 11/30/2022, Final Completion 5/12/2023
CBBEL Project No. 190293.00007

Bids Opened June 16, 2022

ITEM NO SP PAY CODE ITEM UNIT QUANTITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 20101200 TREE ROOT PRUNING EACH 4 150.00$                600.00$                75.00$                  300.00$                175.00$                700.00$                110.00$                440.00$                95.00$                  380.00$                4.00$                    16.00$                  -$                      
2 20101300 TREE PRUNING (1 TO 10 INCH DIAMETER) EACH 1 100.00$                100.00$                100.00$                100.00$                450.00$                450.00$                100.00$                100.00$                105.00$                105.00$                1.00$                    1.00$                    -$                      
3 20101350 TREE PRUNING (OVER 10 INCH DIAMETER) EACH 3 125.00$                375.00$                150.00$                450.00$                750.00$                2,250.00$             200.00$                600.00$                110.00$                330.00$                1.00$                    3.00$                    -$                      
4 20201200 REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL OF UNSUITABLE MATERIAL CU YD 48 50.00$                  2,400.00$             0.01$                    0.48$                    55.00$                  2,640.00$             62.00$                  2,976.00$             5.00$                    240.00$                32.00$                  1,536.00$             -$                      
5 28000500 INLET AND PIPE PROTECTION EACH 10 200.00$                2,000.00$             150.00$                1,500.00$             200.00$                2,000.00$             140.00$                1,400.00$             110.00$                1,100.00$             283.00$                2,830.00$             -$                      
6 28000510 INLET FILTERS EACH 13 150.00$                1,950.00$             125.00$                1,625.00$             200.00$                2,600.00$             140.00$                1,820.00$             110.00$                1,430.00$             310.00$                4,030.00$             -$                      
7 * 30300001 AGGREGATE SUBGRADE IMPROVEMENT CU YD 48 50.00$                  2,400.00$             0.01$                    0.48$                    55.00$                  2,640.00$             49.00$                  2,352.00$             5.00$                    240.00$                46.00$                  2,208.00$             -$                      
8 * 56103000 DUCTILE IRON WATER MAIN   6" FOOT 95 115.00$                10,925.00$           125.00$                11,875.00$           100.00$                9,500.00$             104.00$                9,880.00$             30.00$                  2,850.00$             138.00$                13,110.00$           -$                      
9 * 56103100 DUCTILE IRON WATER MAIN   8" FOOT 1370 125.00$                171,250.00$         103.00$                141,110.00$         107.00$                146,590.00$         140.00$                191,800.00$         175.00$                239,750.00$         166.00$                227,420.00$         -$                      

10 * 56105000 WATER VALVES   8" EACH 3 2,500.00$             7,500.00$             2,870.00$             8,610.00$             2,250.00$             6,750.00$             2,400.00$             7,200.00$             1,500.00$             4,500.00$             2,805.00$             8,415.00$             -$                      
11 * 56300100 ADJUSTING SANITARY SEWERS, 8-INCH DIAMETER OR LESS FOOT 150 75.00$                  11,250.00$           90.00$                  13,500.00$           150.00$                22,500.00$           48.00$                  7,200.00$             25.00$                  3,750.00$             143.00$                21,450.00$           -$                      
12 * 56400500 FIRE HYDRANTS TO BE REMOVED EACH 3 850.00$                2,550.00$             750.00$                2,250.00$             1,605.00$             4,815.00$             750.00$                2,250.00$             500.00$                1,500.00$             1,512.00$             4,536.00$             -$                      
13 * 56400820 FIRE HYDRANT WITH AUXILIARY VALVE AND VALVE BOX EACH 5 7,500.00$             37,500.00$           7,825.00$             39,125.00$           6,500.00$             32,500.00$           7,000.00$             35,000.00$           8,500.00$             42,500.00$           4,292.00$             21,460.00$           -$                      
14 60248700 VALVE VAULTS, TYPE A, 4'-DIAMETER, TYPE 1 FRAME, CLOSED LID EACH 3 3,500.00$             10,500.00$           2,550.00$             7,650.00$             2,250.00$             6,750.00$             2,600.00$             7,800.00$             1,500.00$             4,500.00$             3,061.00$             9,183.00$             -$                      
15 * 67100100 MOBILIZATION L SUM 1 28,000.00$           28,000.00$           20,000.00$           20,000.00$           25,000.00$           25,000.00$           25,000.00$           25,000.00$           25,000.00$           25,000.00$           8,873.00$             8,873.00$             -$                      
16 * X2080250 TRENCH BACKFILL, SPECIAL CU YD 985 75.00$                  73,875.00$           0.01$                    9.85$                    50.00$                  49,250.00$           10.00$                  9,850.00$             1.00$                    985.00$                49.00$                  48,265.00$           -$                      
17 * X5610746 WATER MAIN LINE STOP   6" EACH 1 5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             6,775.00$             6,775.00$             4,000.00$             4,000.00$             3,500.00$             3,500.00$             21,515.00$           21,515.00$           -$                      
18 * XX006238 STORM SEWER DUCTILE IRON 15" FOOT 41 150.00$                6,150.00$             180.00$                7,380.00$             175.00$                7,175.00$             173.00$                7,093.00$             215.00$                8,815.00$             452.00$                18,532.00$           -$                      
19 * Z0013798 CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT L SUM 1 7,500.00$             7,500.00$             20,000.00$           20,000.00$           7,500.00$             7,500.00$             10,000.00$           10,000.00$           1,500.00$             1,500.00$             7,781.00$             7,781.00$             -$                      
20 * Z0017400 DRAINAGE & UTILITY STRUCTURES TO BE ADJUSTED EACH 3 750.00$                2,250.00$             725.00$                2,175.00$             750.00$                2,250.00$             1,200.00$             3,600.00$             500.00$                1,500.00$             1,640.00$             4,920.00$             -$                      
21 * N/A CLASS D PATCHES, SPECIAL, 6 INCH SQ YD 1500 60.00$                  90,000.00$           54.00$                  81,000.00$           63.00$                  94,500.00$           74.00$                  111,000.00$         52.00$                  78,000.00$           68.00$                  102,000.00$         -$                      
22 * N/A EXPLORATION TRENCH, SPECIAL FOOT 50 50.00$                  2,500.00$             50.00$                  2,500.00$             75.00$                  3,750.00$             32.00$                  1,600.00$             25.00$                  1,250.00$             227.00$                11,350.00$           -$                      
23 * N/A HYDRANT FLOW TESTING EACH 2 750.00$                1,500.00$             1,250.00$             2,500.00$             900.00$                1,800.00$             2,000.00$             4,000.00$             250.00$                500.00$                1,556.00$             3,112.00$             -$                      
24 * N/A IRRIGATION REPAIR UNIT 5000 1.00$                    5,000.00$             1.00$                    5,000.00$             1.00$                    5,000.00$             1.00$                    5,000.00$             1.00$                    5,000.00$             1.00$                    5,000.00$             -$                      
25 * N/A MISCELLANEOUS ADDITIONS AT THE VILLAGE'S DISCRETION UNIT 20000 1.00$                    20,000.00$           1.00$                    20,000.00$           1.00$                    20,000.00$           1.00$                    20,000.00$           1.00$                    20,000.00$           1.00$                    20,000.00$           -$                      
26 * N/A PARKWAY RESTORATION-SEEDING SQ YD 1650 16.00$                  26,400.00$           10.50$                  17,325.00$           15.00$                  24,750.00$           10.00$                  16,500.00$           12.00$                  19,800.00$           7.00$                    11,550.00$           -$                      
27 * N/A RECORD DRAWINGS LSUM 1 1,500.00$             1,500.00$             1,000.00$             1,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             100.00$                100.00$                5,387.00$             5,387.00$             -$                      
28 * N/A SHUTDOWN CONNECTION TO EXISTING WATER MAIN EACH 2 3,500.00$             7,000.00$             7,500.00$             15,000.00$           3,000.00$             6,000.00$             5,000.00$             10,000.00$           5,500.00$             11,000.00$           12,365.00$           24,730.00$           -$                      
29 * N/A TEMPORARY STONE LSUM 1 5,000.00$             5,000.00$             0.01$                    0.01$                    3,500.00$             3,500.00$             100.00$                100.00$                5,000.00$             5,000.00$             6,512.00$             6,512.00$             -$                      
30 * N/A TRAFFIC CONTROL AND PROTECTION (SPECIAL) LSUM 1 20,000.00$           20,000.00$           20,000.00$           20,000.00$           10,000.00$           10,000.00$           29,400.00$           29,400.00$           25,000.00$           25,000.00$           8,325.00$             8,325.00$             -$                      
31 * N/A VALVE BOXES TO BE ABANDONED EACH 2 300.00$                600.00$                400.00$                800.00$                250.00$                500.00$                50.00$                  100.00$                500.00$                1,000.00$             567.00$                1,134.00$             -$                      
32 * N/A WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT - INTERIOR RESTORATION EACH 1 3,500.00$             3,500.00$             500.00$                500.00$                5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             1,500.00$             1,500.00$             7,781.00$             7,781.00$             -$                      
33 * N/A WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT (PRIVATE) - LEAD SERVICE REPLACEMENT FOOT 50 100.00$                5,000.00$             61.00$                  3,050.00$             150.00$                7,500.00$             140.00$                7,000.00$             75.00$                  3,750.00$             162.00$                8,100.00$             -$                      
34 * N/A WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT (PUBLIC), LONG SIDE (1.5" DIA. OR LESS) EACH 15 5,000.00$             75,000.00$           3,250.00$             48,750.00$           4,000.00$             60,000.00$           4,000.00$             60,000.00$           4,950.00$             74,250.00$           3,960.00$             59,400.00$           -$                      
35 * N/A WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT (PUBLIC), SHORT SIDE (1.5" DIA. OR LESS) EACH 14 3,750.00$             52,500.00$           2,850.00$             39,900.00$           3,000.00$             42,000.00$           3,000.00$             42,000.00$           4,050.00$             56,700.00$           2,287.00$             32,018.00$           -$                      

* DENOTES SPECIAL PROVISION
TOTAL 699,575.00$         539,985.82$         629,935.00$         647,061.00$         647,325.00$         732,483.00$         NO BID

HOLIDAY SEWER & WATER 
CONSTRUCTION, INC.

H. LINDEN & SONS SEWER AND 
WATER, INC. PT FERRO CONSTRUCTION CO. LEN COX & SONS EXCAVATINGENGINEER'S ESTIMATE AUSTIN TYLER CONSTRUCTION, 

INC. BISPING CONSTRUCTION

N:\NewLenox\190293\190293.00007\Admin\Bidding\BidTabulation_2022_0616.xlsx



Village of New Lenox
Oakview Drive Water Main Replacement Project 
Bid Alternate #2 - Final Completion 5/26/2023
CBBEL Project No. 190293.00007

Bids Opened June 16, 2022

ITEM NO SP PAY CODE ITEM UNIT QUANTITY UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 20101200 TREE ROOT PRUNING EACH 4 150.00$                600.00$                75.00$                  300.00$                0.01$                    0.04$                    175.00$                700.00$                110.00$                440.00$                4.00$                    16.00$                  -$                      
2 20101300 TREE PRUNING (1 TO 10 INCH DIAMETER) EACH 1 100.00$                100.00$                100.00$                100.00$                0.01$                    0.01$                    450.00$                450.00$                100.00$                100.00$                1.00$                    1.00$                    -$                      
3 20101350 TREE PRUNING (OVER 10 INCH DIAMETER) EACH 3 125.00$                375.00$                150.00$                450.00$                0.01$                    0.03$                    750.00$                2,250.00$             200.00$                600.00$                1.00$                    3.00$                    -$                      
4 20201200 REMOVAL AND DISPOSAL OF UNSUITABLE MATERIAL CU YD 48 50.00$                  2,400.00$             0.01$                    0.48$                    0.01$                    0.48$                    55.00$                  2,640.00$             62.00$                  2,976.00$             32.00$                  1,536.00$             -$                      
5 28000500 INLET AND PIPE PROTECTION EACH 10 200.00$                2,000.00$             150.00$                1,500.00$             150.00$                1,500.00$             200.00$                2,000.00$             140.00$                1,400.00$             283.00$                2,830.00$             -$                      
6 28000510 INLET FILTERS EACH 13 150.00$                1,950.00$             125.00$                1,625.00$             0.01$                    0.13$                    200.00$                2,600.00$             140.00$                1,820.00$             310.00$                4,030.00$             -$                      
7 * 30300001 AGGREGATE SUBGRADE IMPROVEMENT CU YD 48 50.00$                  2,400.00$             0.01$                    0.48$                    0.01$                    0.48$                    55.00$                  2,640.00$             49.00$                  2,352.00$             46.00$                  2,208.00$             -$                      
8 * 56103000 DUCTILE IRON WATER MAIN   6" FOOT 95 115.00$                10,925.00$           125.00$                11,875.00$           150.00$                14,250.00$           100.00$                9,500.00$             104.00$                9,880.00$             138.00$                13,110.00$           -$                      
9 * 56103100 DUCTILE IRON WATER MAIN   8" FOOT 1370 125.00$                171,250.00$         111.00$                152,070.00$         147.00$                201,390.00$         107.00$                146,590.00$         140.00$                191,800.00$         166.00$                227,420.00$         -$                      

10 * 56105000 WATER VALVES   8" EACH 3 2,500.00$             7,500.00$             2,870.00$             8,610.00$             3,200.00$             9,600.00$             2,250.00$             6,750.00$             2,400.00$             7,200.00$             2,805.00$             8,415.00$             -$                      
11 * 56300100 ADJUSTING SANITARY SEWERS, 8-INCH DIAMETER OR LESS FOOT 150 75.00$                  11,250.00$           90.00$                  13,500.00$           165.00$                24,750.00$           150.00$                22,500.00$           48.00$                  7,200.00$             143.00$                21,450.00$           -$                      
12 * 56400500 FIRE HYDRANTS TO BE REMOVED EACH 3 850.00$                2,550.00$             750.00$                2,250.00$             1,400.00$             4,200.00$             1,605.00$             4,815.00$             750.00$                2,250.00$             1,512.00$             4,536.00$             -$                      
13 * 56400820 FIRE HYDRANT WITH AUXILIARY VALVE AND VALVE BOX EACH 5 7,500.00$             37,500.00$           7,825.00$             39,125.00$           8,000.00$             40,000.00$           6,500.00$             32,500.00$           7,000.00$             35,000.00$           4,292.00$             21,460.00$           -$                      
14 60248700 VALVE VAULTS, TYPE A, 4'-DIAMETER, TYPE 1 FRAME, CLOSED LID EACH 3 3,500.00$             10,500.00$           2,550.00$             7,650.00$             3,050.00$             9,150.00$             2,250.00$             6,750.00$             2,600.00$             7,800.00$             3,061.00$             9,183.00$             -$                      
15 * 67100100 MOBILIZATION L SUM 1 28,000.00$           28,000.00$           20,000.00$           20,000.00$           1.00$                    1.00$                    15,000.00$           15,000.00$           25,000.00$           25,000.00$           8,873.00$             8,873.00$             -$                      
16 * X2080250 TRENCH BACKFILL, SPECIAL CU YD 985 75.00$                  73,875.00$           0.01$                    9.85$                    0.01$                    9.85$                    50.00$                  49,250.00$           1.00$                    985.00$                49.00$                  48,265.00$           -$                      
17 * X5610746 WATER MAIN LINE STOP   6" EACH 1 5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             6,775.00$             6,775.00$             4,000.00$             4,000.00$             21,515.00$           21,515.00$           -$                      
18 * XX006238 STORM SEWER DUCTILE IRON 15" FOOT 41 150.00$                6,150.00$             180.00$                7,380.00$             185.00$                7,585.00$             175.00$                7,175.00$             173.00$                7,093.00$             452.00$                18,532.00$           -$                      
19 * Z0013798 CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT L SUM 1 7,500.00$             7,500.00$             20,000.00$           20,000.00$           2,500.00$             2,500.00$             7,500.00$             7,500.00$             10,000.00$           10,000.00$           7,781.00$             7,781.00$             -$                      
20 * Z0017400 DRAINAGE & UTILITY STRUCTURES TO BE ADJUSTED EACH 3 750.00$                2,250.00$             725.00$                2,175.00$             475.00$                1,425.00$             750.00$                2,250.00$             1,200.00$             3,600.00$             1,640.00$             4,920.00$             -$                      
21 * N/A CLASS D PATCHES, SPECIAL, 6 INCH SQ YD 1500 60.00$                  90,000.00$           54.00$                  81,000.00$           53.00$                  79,500.00$           63.00$                  94,500.00$           74.00$                  111,000.00$         68.00$                  102,000.00$         -$                      
22 * N/A EXPLORATION TRENCH, SPECIAL FOOT 50 50.00$                  2,500.00$             50.00$                  2,500.00$             40.00$                  2,000.00$             75.00$                  3,750.00$             32.00$                  1,600.00$             227.00$                11,350.00$           -$                      
23 * N/A HYDRANT FLOW TESTING EACH 2 750.00$                1,500.00$             1,250.00$             2,500.00$             1.00$                    2.00$                    900.00$                1,800.00$             2,000.00$             4,000.00$             1,556.00$             3,112.00$             -$                      
24 * N/A IRRIGATION REPAIR UNIT 5000 1.00$                    5,000.00$             1.00$                    5,000.00$             1.00$                    5,000.00$             1.00$                    5,000.00$             1.00$                    5,000.00$             1.00$                    5,000.00$             -$                      
25 * N/A MISCELLANEOUS ADDITIONS AT THE VILLAGE'S DISCRETION UNIT 20000 1.00$                    20,000.00$           1.00$                    20,000.00$           1.00$                    20,000.00$           1.00$                    20,000.00$           1.00$                    20,000.00$           1.00$                    20,000.00$           -$                      
26 * N/A PARKWAY RESTORATION-SEEDING SQ YD 1650 16.00$                  26,400.00$           10.50$                  17,325.00$           10.50$                  17,325.00$           15.00$                  24,750.00$           10.00$                  16,500.00$           7.00$                    11,550.00$           -$                      
27 * N/A RECORD DRAWINGS LSUM 1 1,500.00$             1,500.00$             1,000.00$             1,000.00$             1.00$                    1.00$                    5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,387.00$             5,387.00$             -$                      
28 * N/A SHUTDOWN CONNECTION TO EXISTING WATER MAIN EACH 2 3,500.00$             7,000.00$             7,500.00$             15,000.00$           6,000.00$             12,000.00$           3,000.00$             6,000.00$             5,000.00$             10,000.00$           12,365.00$           24,730.00$           -$                      
29 * N/A TEMPORARY STONE LSUM 1 5,000.00$             5,000.00$             0.01$                    0.01$                    0.01$                    0.01$                    3,500.00$             3,500.00$             100.00$                100.00$                6,512.00$             6,512.00$             -$                      
30 * N/A TRAFFIC CONTROL AND PROTECTION (SPECIAL) LSUM 1 20,000.00$           20,000.00$           20,000.00$           20,000.00$           10,500.00$           10,500.00$           10,000.00$           10,000.00$           19,400.00$           19,400.00$           8,325.00$             8,325.00$             -$                      
31 * N/A VALVE BOXES TO BE ABANDONED EACH 2 300.00$                600.00$                400.00$                800.00$                750.00$                1,500.00$             250.00$                500.00$                50.00$                  100.00$                567.00$                1,134.00$             -$                      
32 * N/A WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT - INTERIOR RESTORATION EACH 1 3,500.00$             3,500.00$             500.00$                500.00$                5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             5,000.00$             7,781.00$             7,781.00$             -$                      
33 * N/A WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT (PRIVATE) - LEAD SERVICE REPLACEMENT FOOT 50 100.00$                5,000.00$             61.00$                  3,050.00$             100.00$                5,000.00$             150.00$                7,500.00$             140.00$                7,000.00$             162.00$                8,100.00$             -$                      
34 * N/A WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT (PUBLIC), LONG SIDE (1.5" DIA. OR LESS) EACH 15 5,000.00$             75,000.00$           3,250.00$             48,750.00$           4,300.00$             64,500.00$           4,000.00$             60,000.00$           3,800.00$             57,000.00$           3,960.00$             59,400.00$           -$                      
35 * N/A WATER SERVICE REPLACEMENT (PUBLIC), SHORT SIDE (1.5" DIA. OR LESS) EACH 14 3,750.00$             52,500.00$           2,850.00$             39,900.00$           3,600.00$             50,400.00$           3,000.00$             42,000.00$           2,800.00$             39,200.00$           2,287.00$             32,018.00$           -$                      

* DENOTES SPECIAL PROVISION
TOTAL 699,575.00$         550,945.82$         594,090.03$         619,935.00$         622,396.00$         732,483.00$         NO BID

HOLIDAY SEWER & WATER 
CONSTRUCTION, INC.LEN COX & SONS EXCAVATINGENGINEER'S ESTIMATE AUSTIN TYLER CONSTRUCTION, 

INC. BISPING CONSTRUCTIONH. LINDEN & SONS SEWER AND 
WATER, INC.PT FERRO CONSTRUCTION CO.
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